
ITB No.: 09-0415 - Chemical Lawn Maintenance for Athletic Fields

Tabulation of Bids

ITB Opening Date: June 17, 2009

Contracting Officer: Freddy Suarez

Ocoee Longwood Apopka Winter Grdn. Oviedo Apopka Eustis Fruitland Park

1 Month of January 1 Ea. $1,405.00 $3,642.00 $3,640.00 $3,300.00 $5,400.00 $3,888.00 $4,100.00 $3,459.00 

2 Month of February 1 Ea. $1,505.00 $3,642.00 $5,320.00 $3,250.00 $7,200.00 $4,752.00 $5,050.00 $5,058.00 

3 Month of March 1 Ea. $1,645.00 $6,142.00 $10,000.00 $14,000.00 $9,600.00 $13,600.00 $13,900.00 $12,791.00 

4 Month of April 1 Ea. $1,505.00 $3,642.00 $4,150.00 $3,200.00 $7,200.00 $13,468.00 $13,700.00 $8,413.00 

5 Month of May 1 Ea. $1,405.00 $8,642.00 $7,514.00 $9,392.00 $6,000.00 $4,752.00 $5,050.00 $13,244.00 

6 Month of June 1 Ea. $1,405.00 $3,642.00 $3,640.00 $3,200.00 $5,400.00 $3,888.00 $4,100.00 $4,308.00 

7 Month of July 1 Ea. $1,705.00 $6,142.00 $6,140.00 $8,700.00 $9,600.00 $13,600.00 $13,900.00 $7,529.00 

8 Month of August 1 Ea. $1,405.00 $3,642.00 $3,640.00 $3,200.00 $5,400.00 $4,752.00 $5,050.00 $4,223.00 

9 Month of September 1 Ea. $1,505.00 $3,945.00 $12,820.00 $15,200.00 $5,400.00 $3,888.00 $4,100.00 $16,848.00 

10 Month of October 1 Ea. $1,405.00 $3,642.00 $3,640.00 $3,176.00 $5,000.00 $3,888.00 $4,100.00 $3,118.00 

11 Month of November 1 Ea. $1,435.00 $4,249.00 $3,640.00 $1,925.00 $5,000.00 $3,888.00 $4,100.00 $3,712.00 

12 Month of December 1 Ea. $1,405.00 $3,642.00 $3,640.00 $1,900.00 $5,000.00 $3,888.00 $4,100.00 $3,118.00 

$17,730.00 $54,614.00 $67,784.00 $70,443.00 $76,200.00 $78,252.00 $81,250.00 $85,821.00 

Item
North Lake 

Community Park
Application Unit

TOTAL PRICE FOR SECTION 1

Millennium 

Grounds
TruGrenGroundTek KirklandD&A

City

PRICING SECTION 1: Bermuda Grass Price per Month

Central Florida

Landscaping

Mercer Pest 

Control

Stephens 

Grading
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ITB No.: 09-0415 - Chemical Lawn Maintenance for Athletic Fields

Tabulation of Bids

ITB Opening Date: June 17, 2009

Contracting Officer: Freddy Suarez

Applications Unit

(A) (B)

1 Astor Park 5 Ea. $1,450.00 $7,480.00 $1,800.00 $3,500.00 $2,750.00 $8,797.00 $10,000.00 $6,570.00 

2 Paisley Comm. Park 5 Ea. $850.00 $2,415.00 $900.00 $3,000.00 $1,250.00 $4,031.24 $5,500.00 $2,452.00 

3 PEAR Park 5 Ea. $1,325.00 $7,480.00 $1,800.00 $4,750.00 $2,750.00 $9,297.00 $10,750.00 $4,045.00 

4 East Lake Comm. Park 5 Ea. $6,800.00 No Bid $18,590.00 No Bid $6,000.00 See addendum No bid $22,324.00 

Line 4 Omitted ($6,800.00) ($18,590.00) ($6,000.00) ($22,324.00)

1 Astor Park 2 Ea. $400.00 $60.00 Included $140.00 $200.00 $350.00 No bid No Bid

2 Paisley Comm. Park 2 Ea. $400.00 No Bid Included $140.00 $100.00 $350.00 No bid No Bid

Line 2 Omitted ($400.00) ($140.00) ($100.00) ($350.00)

3 PEAR Park 2 Ea. $400.00 No Bid Included $200.00 $200.00 $350.00 No bid No Bid

Line 3 Omitted ($400.00) ($200.00) ($200.00) ($350.00)

4 North Lake Comm. Park 2 Ea. $1,200.00 $500.00 $720.00 $2,000.00 $1,200.00 $350.00 No bid $2,200.00 

5 East Lake Comm. Park 2 Ea. $800.00 No Bid $720.00 No Bid $1,200.00 $350.00 No bid $2,200.00 

Line 5 Omitted ($800.00) ($720.00) ($1,200.00) ($350.00) ($2,200.00)

1 Astor Park 4 Ea. $600.00 No Bid Included $200.00 $400.00 $200.00 No bid No Bid

Line 1 Omitted ($600.00) ($200.00) ($400.00) ($200.00)

2 Paisley Comm. Park 4 Ea. $600.00 No Bid Included $200.00 $200.00 $200.00 No bid No Bid

Line 2 Omitted ($600.00) ($200.00) ($200.00) ($200.00)

3 PEAR Park 4 Ea. $600.00 No Bid Included $200.00 $400.00 $200.00 No bid No Bid

Line 3 Omitted ($600.00) ($200.00) ($400.00) ($200.00)

4 North Lake Comm. Park 4 Ea. $1,200.00 $400.00 Included $1,600.00 $1,200.00 $200.00 No bid $4,000.00 

5 East Lake Comm. Park 4 Ea. $1,000.00 No Bid Included No Bid $1,200.00 $200.00 No bid $4,000.00 

Line 5 Omitted ($1,000.00) ($1,200.00) ($200.00) ($4,000.00)

$6,425.00 $18,335.00 $5,220.00 $14,990.00 $9,350.00 $23,025.24 $26,250.00 $19,267.00 

$24,155.00 $72,949.00 $73,004.00 $85,433.00 $85,550.00 $101,277.24 $107,500.00 $105,088.00 TOTAL FOR PRICING SECTIONS 1 & 2

Palms (Optional Services) Extended Price

TOTAL PRICE FOR SECTION 2

Mercer Pest 

Control
Kirkland

Millennium 

Grounds
D&A TruGreen

Extended Price

Item Location GroundTek
Central Florida

Landscaping

PRICING SECTION 2: St. Augustine and Bahia Grass

Stephens 

Grading

Shrubs and Ornamentals (Optional Services)

Extended Price
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ITB No.: 09-0415 - Chemical Lawn Maintenance for Athletic Fields

Tabulation of Bids

ITB Opening Date: June 17, 2009

Contracting Officer: Freddy Suarez

GroundTek D&A Kirkland
Millennium 

Grounds

Central Florida

Landscaping

Mercer Pest

Control

Stephens 

Grading
TruGreen

$1,500.00 $3,642.00 $4,150.00 $3,700.00 $6,000.00 $13,668.00 $13,900.00 $6,065.22

$1,470.00 $3,642.00 $3,640.00 $3,700.00 $5,400.00 $4,952.00 $5,200.00 $3,961.30

$1,505.00 $3,642.00 $4,150.00 $3,700.00 $6,000.00 $13,668.00 $13,900.00 $5,077.39

$1,405.00 $3,642.00 $3,640.00 $3,700.00 $5,400.00 $4,952.00 $5,250.00 $4,390.38

$1.500 $0.002 $0.015 $0.027 $0.250 $0.030 $0.030 $0.015

$748,000.00 $971.00 $7,500.00 $13,700.00 $124,000.00 $14,970.00 $14,970.00 $7,485.00

$753,880.00 $15,539.00 $23,080.00 $28,500.00 $146,800.00 $52,210.00 $53,220.00 $26,979.29 

1 Month of January 1 Ea. $1,325.00 $3,594.00 $4,550.00 $2,640.00 $6,000.00 $4,888.00 $5,100.00 $3,459.00 

2 Month of February 1 Ea. $1,445.00 $3,594.00 $6,650.00 $2,600.00 $8,000.00 $5,752.00 $6,000.00 $5,058.00 

3 Month of March 1 Ea. $1,600.00 $6,094.00 $12,500.00 $11,200.00 $10,500.00 $14,600.00 $14,900.00 $12,791.00 

4 Month of April 1 Ea. $1,445.00 $3,594.00 $5,187.00 $2,560.00 $8,000.00 $14,468.00 $14,700.00 $8,413.00 

5 Month of May 1 Ea. $1,325.00 $8,394.00 $9,392.00 $7,520.00 $7,000.00 $5,752.00 $6,000.00 $13,244.00 

6 Month of June 1 Ea. $1,325.00 $3,594.00 $4,550.00 $2,560.00 $6,000.00 $4,888.00 $5,100.00 $4,308.00 

7 Month of July 1 Ea. $1,695.00 $6,094.00 $7,675.00 $7,000.00 $10,500.00 $14,600.00 $14,900.00 $7,529.00 

8 Month of August 1 Ea. $1,325.00 $3,594.00 $4,550.00 $2,560.00 $6,000.00 $5,752.00 $6,000.00 $4,223.00 

9 Month of September 1 Ea. $1,445.00 $3,893.00 $16,570.00 $12,160.00 $6,000.00 $4,888.00 $5,100.00 $16,848.00 

10 Month of October 1 Ea. $1,325.00 $3,594.00 $4,550.00 $2,500.00 $5,400.00 $4,888.00 $5,100.00 $3,118.00 

11 Month of November 1 Ea. $1,395.00 $4,193.00 $4,550.00 $1,550.00 $5,400.00 $4,888.00 $5,100.00 $3,712.00 

12 Month of December 1 Ea. $1,400.00 $3,594.00 $4,550.00 $1,520.00 $5,400.00 $4,888.00 $5,100.00 $3,118.00 

$17,050.00 $53,826.00 $85,274.00 $56,370.00 $84,200.00 $90,252.00 $93,100.00 $85,821.00 

Month of September overseeding athletic field with Rye Grass.  

1-Application  Price per sq.ft. (499,000/sq.ft.)

D&AGroundTek Kirkland

Month of April application using Revolver Herbicide

1-Application

Item
East Lake Community 

Park

OPTIONAL PRICING - Bermuda Grass Optional Pricing with Sencor/MSMA

Application Unit

TOTAL

Stephens 

Grading

Month of August application using LESCO Momentum

1-Application

TOTAL

Month of August application using Revolver Herbicide

1-Application

Month of April application using LESCO Momentum

1-Application

OPTIONAL PRICING: Fertilization and Pest Control Program for Bermuda Grass

North Lake Community Park

Millennium 

Grounds
TruGreen

Central Florida

Landscaping

Mercer Pest

Control
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ITB No.: 09-0415 - Chemical Lawn Maintenance for Athletic Fields

Tabulation of Bids

ITB Opening Date: June 17, 2009

Contracting Officer: Freddy Suarez

GroundTek D&A Kirkland
Millennium 

Grounds

Central Florida

Landscaping

Mercer Pest

Control

Stephens

Grading
TruGreen

$1,505.00 $3,594.00 $5,187.00 $3,700.00 $6,000.00 $14,668.00 $14,900.00 $6,065.22

$1,400.00 $3,594.00 $4,550.00 $3,500.00 $7,000.00 $5,952.00 $6,250.00 $3,961.30

$1,445.00 $3,594.00 $4,150.00 $3,500.00 $8,600.00 $14,668.00 $14,900.00 $5,077.39

$1,325.00 $3,594.00 $3,640.00 $3,500.00 $5,400.00 $6,952.00 $7,250.00 $4,390.38

$1.50 $900.00 $11,250.00 $12,000.00 $0.25 $0.03 $0.03 $0.015

$5,676.50 $15,276.00 $28,777.00 $26,200.00 $27,000.25 $42,240.03 $43,300.03 $19,494.31 

Month of September overseeding athletic field with Rye Grass

1-Application  Price per sq.ft.

Month of August application using Revolver Herbicide

1-Application

Month of April application using LESCO Momentum

1-Application

TOTAL

Month of April application using Revolver Herbicide

1-Application

East Lake Community Park

OPTIONAL PRICING: Fertilization and Pest Control Program for Bermuda Grass

Month of August application using LESCO Momentum

1-Application
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