
RFP 10-0609, Storm Water Pipe/Water Quality Unit Cleaning, Videoing and Related Services

 Tabulation Sheet

DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE PER LINEAR FOOT

ABSOLUTE VAC & JET SHENANDOAH INLINER

PIPE CLEANING SIZE FOR ROUND OR

EQUIVALENT ELLIPTICAL DIAMETER LIGHT MEDIUM HEAVY LIGHT MEDIUM HEAVY LIGHT MEDIUM HEAVY LIGHT MEDIUM HEAVY

 

12” 0.75 1.50 3.00 1.25 2.50 5.00 1 2.00 3 1.00 1.50 2.00

      

15” 1.00 1.50 3.00 1.50 3.00 6.00 1.00 2.00 3.00 1.25 1.75 3.00

   

18” 1.50 2.00 4.00 1.75 3.50 7.00 1.50 2.50 4.50 1.75 2.00 4.00

24” 2.50 3.00 6.50 2.00 4.00 8.00 1.50 2.50 4.50 2.00 3.00 6.00

30” 3.00 5.00 9.00 2.25 4.50 9.00 2.00 4.00 6.00 3.00 4.50 8.00

36” 3.50 7.00 13.00 2.50 5.00 10.00 2.00 4.00 6.00 3.50 5.50 10.00

42” 4.50 9.00 17.00 2.75 5.25 11.50 4.00 6.00 8.00 4.00 6.00 12.00

48” 6.00 14.00 23.00 3.25 6.25 14.00 5.00 7.00 9.00 5.00 7.00 16.00

54” 8.00 16.00 25.00 3.75 7.25 17.50 6.00 8.00 10.00 7.00 10.00 18.00

60” 9.00 16.50 28.00 4.00 8.25 20.00 10.00 15.00 20.00 10.00 12.00 24.00

66” 9.00 16.50 28.00 5.00 9.50 22.50 12.00 17.00 22.00 12.00 15.00 26.00

72” 9.00 16.50 28.00 6.00 11.50 25.00 14.00 19.00 24.00 14.00 17.00 30.00

57.75 108.50 187.50 36.00 70.50 155.50 60.00 89.00 120.00 64.50 85.25 159.00



DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE PER EACH

PLUG INSTALLATION & REMOVAL

ROUND OR EQUIVALENT ELLIPTICAL

DIAMETER

12” 1.00 312.50 25.00 25.00

15” 1.00 312.50 25.00 25.00

18” 1.00 312.50 25.00 25.00

24” 1.00 312.50 35.00 50.00

30” 1.00 312.50 35.00 75.00

36” 1.00 312.50 35.00 100.00

42” 1.00 312.50 55.00 150.00

48” 350.00 437.50 55.00 175.00

60” 350.00 437.50 95.00 250.00

66” 350.00 437.50 125.00 300.00

72” 350.00 437.50 150.00 400.00

1407.00 3937.50 660.00 1575.00

DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE PER EACH

DE-WATERING 

ROUND OR EQUIVALENT ELLIPTICAL                    

DIAMETER

12” 1.00 4.80 165.00 1.00

15” 1.00 5.00 165.00 1.00



18” 1.00 5.25 165.00 1.00

24” 100.00 5.50 165.00 1.00

30” 200.00 6.00 247.50 1.00

36” 200.00 6.00 247.50 1.00

42” 200.00 7.20 247.50 1.00

48” 500.00 7.20 330.00 1.00

60” 500.00 7.80 330.00 1.00

66” 500.00 7.80 412.50 1.00

72” 500.00 8.40 412.50 1.00

2703.00 70.95 2887.50 11.00

 

DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE PER LINEAR FOOT

VIDEOING PIPE

ROUND OR EQUIVALENT ELLIPTICAL                     

DIAMETER

                    700.00 per visit

12” 0.55 0.50 1.50

15” 0.55 0.50 1.50

18” 0.55 0.50 1.50

24” 0.55 0.50 1.75

30” 0.80 0.50 1.75

 



36” 0.80 0.50 1.75

42” 0.80 0.50 2.00

48” 2.00 0.50 2.00

60” 2.00 1.00 3.00

66” 2.00 1.50 3.50

72” 2.00 1.50 3.50

12.60 8.00 23.75

DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE PER EACH

Cleaning Box Culverts 1,500       700.00         250.00 per cycle 100.00 per cu yd

DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE PER EACH

CLEANING OF WATER 

QUALITY UNITS

UNIT # 

# 1 200.00 1500.00 1800.00 2500.00

# 2 200.00 1500.00 1800.00 2500.00

# 3 300.00 1500.00 1500.00 1500.00

# 4 300.00 1500.00 1500.00 1000.00

# 5 200.00 1500.00 1500.00 1500.00

# 6 200.00 1500.00 1500.00 1800.00

# 7 350.00 1500.00 2500.00 850.00

# 8 350.00 1500.00 3250.00 750.00



# 9 300.00 1500.00 2200.00 2500.00

# 10 300.00 1500.00 2200.00 2500.00

# 11 250.00 1500.00 2200.00 2500.00

# 12 250.00 1500.00 2200.00 3000.00

# 13 350.00 1500.00 2200.00 2500.00

3550.00 19500.00 26350.00 25400.00

DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE PER LINEAR FOOT

ROOT CLEANING MECHANICAL

ROUND OR EQUIVALENT

ELLIPTICAL DIAMETER

12" 10.00        2.00  5.00 1.50

15" 15.00 2.00 5.00 1.50

18" 20.00 2.00 5.00 2.00

24" 25.00 no bid 7.50 3.00

30" 25.00 no bid 8.50 3.50

36" 20.00 no bid 9.50 5.00

42" 20.00 no bid 10.50 5.00

48" 20.00 no bid 11.50 6.00

60" 20.00 no bid 13.50 10.00

66" 20.00 no bid 14.50 12.00

72" 20.00 no bid 16.50 15.00

215.00 6.00 107.00 64.50

DESCRIPTION



ROOT CLEANING CHEMICAL

ROUND OR EQUIVALENT

ELLIPTICAL DIAMETER

12" 10.00 no bid 2.50 5.00

 

15" 10.00 no bid 2.50 6.00

18" 10.00 no bid 2.50 10.00

24" 10.00 no bid 3.50 25.00

30" 10.00 no bid 4.00 35.00

36" 15.00 no bid 5.00 45.00

42" 15.00 no bid 5.50 50.00

48" 15.00 no bid 6.00 55.00

60" 20.00 no bid 9.00 65.00

66" 20.00 no bid 10.00 70.00

72" 20.00 no bid 12.00 75.00

155.00 62.50 441.00

EMERGENCY ON-CALL SERVICE 300.00 600.00 2500.00 1200.00


