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ITB Number: 10-0820 
     

*CORRECTED* 
  ITB Title:  Leachate Disposal and/or Transportation Services 

      Bid Opening Date:  August 11, 2010  300 pm Option 1 Option 2 Option 3 

Contracting Officer:  Roseann Johnson Site A Site B Site C Site D A A B 

T Wayne Hill Trucking, Inc. 
Bartow, Florida 

Unit Price $0.0575  $0.0575  $0.0575  $0.0575  No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Estimated Quantity 3,000,000 3,000,000 3,000,000 3,000,000       

Extended Price $172,500.00  $172,500.00  $172,500.00  $172,500.00        

Delta Pioneer Inc. 
Boca Raton, Florida 

Unit Price $0.077  $0.077  $0.062  $0.050  No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Estimated Quantity 3,000,000 3,000,000 3,000,000 3,000,000       

Extended Price $231,900.00  $231,900.00  $187,200.00  $149,100.00        

Dedicated Transport, LLC. 
Lakeland, Florida 

Unit Price $0.073  $0.07  $0.07  $0.07  No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Estimated Quantity 3,000,000 3,000,000 3,000,000 3,000,000       

Extended Price $219,000.00  $219,000.00  $219,000.00  $219,000.00        

Barnett Transport, Inc. 
Tuscaloosa, Alabama 

Unit Price $0.0971  $0.0971  $0.0879  $0.0879  No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Estimated Quantity 3,000,000 3,000,000 3,000,000 3,000,000       

Extended Price $291,300.00  $291,300.00  $263,700.00  $263,700.00        

C & W Global 
Winter Garden, Florida 

Unit Price $0.78  $0.78  $0.51  $0.40  No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Estimated Quantity 3,000,000 3,000,000 3,000,000 3,000,000       

Extended Price $2,340,000.00  $2,340,000.00  $1,530,000.00  $1,200,000.00        

Liquid Environmental 
Solutions, LLC 
Jacksonville, Florida 

Unit Price No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.05  $0.069  $0.05  

Estimated Quantity         3,000,000 3,000,000 3,000,000 

Extended Price         $150,000.00  $207,000.00  $150,000.00  

Aqua Clean Environmental 
Co., Inc. 
Lakeland, Florida 

Unit Price No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.06  $0.045  $0.055  

Estimated Quantity         3,000,000 3,000,000 3,000,000 

Extended Price         $180,000.00  $135,000.00  $165,000.00  

 


