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LAKE COUNTY

FIORIDA






	ITB No. 13-0037

	ITB Title:  Temporary Labor Services

	Opening Date:  June 26, 2013, 3:00 p.m.

	Contracting Officer:  Susan Dugan

	Vendor Name:
	City and State:
	Customer Service Representative/Receptionist


	Office

Associate I
	Office Associate IV
	Data Entry
	General Labor
	Custodian
	Traffic Flagger
	Landfill Attendant


	Equipment Operator


	Truck Driver
	Delivery

	*AUE Staffing
	Altamonte Springs, FL
	$11.97
	$11.99
	$12.99
	$11.99
	$11.30
	$11.30
	No Bid
	$13.20
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid

	*Beatty’s Services
	Clermont, FL
	$9.56
	$9.56
	$11.94
	$9.56
	$9.56
	$9.56
	$11.94
	$17.94
	$19.11
	$14.33
	$11.94

	Labor Ready
	Eustis, FL
	$16.59
	$18.09
	No Bid
	$15.19
	$12.89
	$12.89
	$13.79
	$13.79
	$17.39
	No Bid
	No Bid

	Spherion
	Leesburg, FL
	$13.21
	$13.21
	$13.90
	$13.21
	$13.49
	$13.49
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	$13.49

	TS Staffing
	Clermont, FL
	$11.00
	$11.15
	$13.01
	$10.96
	$12.99
	$12.99
	No Bid
	No Bid
	$19.00
	No Bid
	No Bid


*Disqualify AUE Staffing because they do not have an office located within the boundaries of Lake County as requested within the ITB request.
*Disqualify Beatty’s Services, Inc., because there are several discrepancies between the ITB request and Beatty’s Services Inc. response.  .  Beatty’s Services Inc. did not respond to the ITB requirements.  Instead, Beatty’s put together their own response of what and how they would provide the services.  Some of the discrepancies are:
a. There is no reference in Beatty’s response to the Administrative Reports we are requiring in our ITB 13-0037, Section 1.16, Administrative Reports.

b. There is no reference in Beatty’s response to the Fidelity Bond noted in Section 1.9.

c. There is no reference in Beatty’s response to Section 2, item 4, Safety equipment.

d. Beatty’s response does not mention Section 2, item 7; temporary labor must be a U.S. citizen or provide documentation evidencing legal permission to work in the U.S.

e. There is language  of how Beatty’s  background checking will be handled but does not mention the requirements of ITB Section 2, item 5, for Local and out of state criminal background checks shall follow the Background Investigation Procedures established by the Florida Department of Law Enforcement, Division of Criminal Justice Standards and Training.

f. There is no reference the response to Section 2, item 7 of the ITB which requires Drug and alcohol screening per the Department of Transportation (DOT) standards for each temporary employee.

g. The response does not address overtime as noted in Section 2, item 10 of the ITB.

h. Page 1 of Beatty’s response directly conflicts with the language in the ITB Section 4, bullet 5, which states “All pricing submitted shall remain valid for a 90 day period.  
i. Page 20 of their response regarding temporary labor hired by the County directly conflicts with what the County is requesting in Section 2.6.

Also, it is noted that the pricing offered by Beatty’s is considerably low in several categories.  The pricing is so low that there may be cause for concern.
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