



LAKE COUNTY

FLORIDA

OFFICE OF PROCUREMENT SERVICES
315 WEST MAIN STREET, SUITE 441
PO BOX 7800
TAVARES FL 32778-7800

PHONE: (352) 343-9839
FAX: 352) 343-9473

ADDENDUM NO. ONE

Date: June 19, 2013

ITB No. 13-0607

**ITB Title: Storm Water Pipe/Water Quality Unit
Cleaning, Video Recording, and Related Services**

It is the vendor's responsibility to ensure their receipt of all addenda, and to clearly acknowledge all addenda within their initial bid or proposal response. Acknowledgement may be confirmed either by inclusion of a signed copy of this addendum with the initial bid or proposal response, or by completion and return of the addendum acknowledgement section of the solicitation. Failure to acknowledge each addendum may prevent the bid or proposal from being considered for award.

This addendum clarifies the date for receipt of bids – BIDS ARE DUE JULY 10, 2013 by 3:00 p.m.
(not July 17, 2013 at 3:00 p.m.)

Written questions received to date:

Question: Could you please give me a historical usage for this contract per year and the previous Contract's bid tabulation?

Answer: The total amount spent under the current contract which became effective October 1, 2010, is approximately \$101,142 to date, for an average of \$37,928 per year. The bid tabulation from the prior bid is included with this Addendum. Bid tabulations and other pertinent information concerning the previous bid or current contract can be found on the Lake County website at www.lakecountyfl.gov under *Doing Business with Lake County*. (Go to *Current Formal Solicitations* for prior bid information; *View Term and Supply Agreements* for current contract information). The prior bid number (and current contract number) is 10-0609.

Firm Name: _____ Date: _____

Signature: _____ Title: _____

Typed/Printed Name: _____

RFP 10-0609, Storm Water Pipe/Water Quality Unit Cleaning, Videoing and Related Services

Tabulation Sheet

DESCRIPTION

UNIT PRICE PER LINEAR FOOT

PIPE CLEANING SIZE FOR ROUND OR EQUIVALENT ELLIPTICAL DIAMETER	<u>ABSOLUTE</u>			<u>VAC & JET</u>			<u>SHENANDOAH</u>			<u>INLINER</u>		
	<u>LIGHT</u>	<u>MEDIUM</u>	<u>HEAVY</u>	<u>LIGHT</u>	<u>MEDIUM</u>	<u>HEAVY</u>	<u>LIGHT</u>	<u>MEDIUM</u>	<u>HEAVY</u>	<u>LIGHT</u>	<u>MEDIUM</u>	<u>HEAVY</u>
12"	0.75	1.50	3.00	1.25	2.50	5.00	1	2.00	3	1.00	1.50	2.00
15"	1.00	1.50	3.00	1.50	3.00	6.00	1.00	2.00	3.00	1.25	1.75	3.00
18"	1.50	2.00	4.00	1.75	3.50	7.00	1.50	2.50	4.50	1.75	2.00	4.00
24"	2.50	3.00	6.50	2.00	4.00	8.00	1.50	2.50	4.50	2.00	3.00	6.00
30"	3.00	5.00	9.00	2.25	4.50	9.00	2.00	4.00	6.00	3.00	4.50	8.00
36"	3.50	7.00	13.00	2.50	5.00	10.00	2.00	4.00	6.00	3.50	5.50	10.00
42"	4.50	9.00	17.00	2.75	5.25	11.50	4.00	6.00	8.00	4.00	6.00	12.00
48"	6.00	14.00	23.00	3.25	6.25	14.00	5.00	7.00	9.00	5.00	7.00	16.00
54"	8.00	16.00	25.00	3.75	7.25	17.50	6.00	8.00	10.00	7.00	10.00	18.00
60"	9.00	16.50	28.00	4.00	8.25	20.00	10.00	15.00	20.00	10.00	12.00	24.00
66"	9.00	16.50	28.00	5.00	9.50	22.50	12.00	17.00	22.00	12.00	15.00	26.00
72"	9.00	16.50	28.00	6.00	11.50	25.00	14.00	19.00	24.00	14.00	17.00	30.00
	57.75	108.50	187.50	36.00	70.50	155.50	60.00	89.00	120.00	64.50	85.25	159.00

DESCRIPTION

UNIT PRICE PER EACH

PLUG INSTALLATION & REMOVAL
ROUND OR EQUIVALENT ELLIPTICAL
DIAMETER

12"	1.00	312.50	25.00	25.00
15"	1.00	312.50	25.00	25.00
18"	1.00	312.50	25.00	25.00
24"	1.00	312.50	35.00	50.00
30"	1.00	312.50	35.00	75.00
36"	1.00	312.50	35.00	100.00
42"	1.00	312.50	55.00	150.00
48"	350.00	437.50	55.00	175.00
60"	350.00	437.50	95.00	250.00
66"	350.00	437.50	125.00	300.00
72"	350.00	437.50	150.00	400.00
	1407.00	3937.50	660.00	1575.00

DESCRIPTION

UNIT PRICE PER EACH

DE-WATERING
ROUND OR EQUIVALENT ELLIPTICAL
DIAMETER

12"	1.00	4.80	165.00	1.00
15"	1.00	5.00	165.00	1.00

18"	1.00	5.25	165.00	1.00
24"	100.00	5.50	165.00	1.00
30"	200.00	6.00	247.50	1.00
36"	200.00	6.00	247.50	1.00
42"	200.00	7.20	247.50	1.00
48"	500.00	7.20	330.00	1.00
60"	500.00	7.80	330.00	1.00
66"	500.00	7.80	412.50	1.00
72"	500.00	8.40	412.50	1.00
	2703.00	70.95	2887.50	11.00

DESCRIPTION

UNIT PRICE PER LINEAR FOOT

VIDEOING PIPE
ROUND OR EQUIVALENT ELLIPTICAL

<u>DIAMETER</u>		700.00 per visit		
12"	0.55		0.50	1.50
15"	0.55		0.50	1.50
18"	0.55		0.50	1.50
24"	0.55		0.50	1.75
30"	0.80		0.50	1.75

36"	0.80		0.50	1.75
42"	0.80		0.50	2.00
48"	2.00		0.50	2.00
60"	2.00		1.00	3.00
66"	2.00		1.50	3.50
72"	2.00		1.50	3.50
	12.60		8.00	23.75

<u>UNIT PRICE PER EACH</u>			
<u>DESCRIPTION</u>			
Cleaning Box Culverts	1,500	700.00	250.00 per cycle
			100.00 per cu yd

<u>UNIT PRICE PER EACH</u>			
<u>DESCRIPTION</u>			

CLEANING OF WATER QUALITY UNITS

<u>UNIT #</u>				
# 1	200.00	1500.00	1800.00	2500.00
# 2	200.00	1500.00	1800.00	2500.00
# 3	300.00	1500.00	1500.00	1500.00
# 4	300.00	1500.00	1500.00	1000.00
# 5	200.00	1500.00	1500.00	1500.00
# 6	200.00	1500.00	1500.00	1800.00
# 7	350.00	1500.00	2500.00	850.00
# 8	350.00	1500.00	3250.00	750.00

# 9	300.00	1500.00	2200.00	2500.00
# 10	300.00	1500.00	2200.00	2500.00
# 11	250.00	1500.00	2200.00	2500.00
# 12	250.00	1500.00	2200.00	3000.00
# 13	350.00	1500.00	2200.00	2500.00
	3550.00	19500.00	26350.00	25400.00

UNIT PRICE PER LINEAR FOOT

ROOT CLEANING MECHANICAL
ROUND OR EQUIVALENT
ELLIPTICAL DIAMETER

<u>12"</u>	10.00	2.00	5.00	1.50
15"	15.00	2.00	5.00	1.50
18"	20.00	2.00	5.00	2.00
24"	25.00	no bid	7.50	3.00
30"	25.00	no bid	8.50	3.50
36"	20.00	no bid	9.50	5.00
42"	20.00	no bid	10.50	5.00
48"	20.00	no bid	11.50	6.00
60"	20.00	no bid	13.50	10.00
66"	20.00	no bid	14.50	12.00
72"	20.00	no bid	16.50	15.00
	215.00	6.00	107.00	64.50

DESCRIPTION

ROOT CLEANING CHEMICAL
ROUND OR EQUIVALENT
ELLIPTICAL DIAMETER

12"	10.00	no bid	2.50	5.00
15"	10.00	no bid	2.50	6.00
18"	10.00	no bid	2.50	10.00
24"	10.00	no bid	3.50	25.00
30"	10.00	no bid	4.00	35.00
36"	15.00	no bid	5.00	45.00
42"	15.00	no bid	5.50	50.00
48"	15.00	no bid	6.00	55.00
60"	20.00	no bid	9.00	65.00
66"	20.00	no bid	10.00	70.00
72"	20.00	no bid	12.00	75.00
	155.00		62.50	441.00

EMERGENCY ON-CALL SERVICE

300.00	600.00	2500.00	1200.00
--------	--------	---------	---------