
14-0618 / Fuel Products  Tabulation of Bids Opened 4-2-14

Great Lakes Petroleum Co.             

Cleveland, OH

Petroleum Traders Corp.              Fort 

Wayne, IN

Port Consolidated                                  

Tampa, FL

Item # 1 $3.411960 No Bid $3.268150

Unleaded Gasoline 87 Octane 200,000 Gallons $682,392.0000  $653,630.0000

Item # 2 $3.541660 No Bid $3.399250

Unleaded Gasoline 89 Octane 45,000 Gallons $159,374.70 $152,966.2500

Item # 3 $3.804860 No Bid $3.656650

Unleaded Gasoline 92/93 Octane 20,000 Gallons $76,097.20 $73,133.0000

Totals $917,863.900000 $879,729.250000

Item # 4 $3.251960 $3.1815 $3.1992

Unleaded Gasoline 87 Octane 330,000 Gallons $1,073,146.8000 $1,049,895.0000 $1,055,719.5000

Item # 5 $3.381660 $3.3026 $3.3303

Unleaded Gasoline 89 Octane 12,000 Gallons $40,579.92 $39,631.2000 $39,963.0000

Item # 6 $3.644860 $3.5600 $3.5877

Unleaded Gasoline 92/93 Octane 1,000 Gallons $3,644.86 $3,560.0000 $3,587.6500

Totals $1,117,371.580000 $1,093,086.200000 $1,099,270.150000

Item # 7 Each No Bid No Bid $3.9207

Diesel, Ultra Low Sulfur 120,000 Gallons $470,484.0000

Item # 8 Each No Bid No Bid $3.6089

Diesel, High Sulfer - Off Road 90,000 Gallons $324,801.0000

Totals $795,285.0000

Item # 9 Each No Bid $3.8112 $3.8487

Diesel, Ultra Low Sulfur 938,000 Gallons $3,574,905.6000 $3,610,080.6000

Item # 10 Each No Bid $3.4994 $3.5369

Diesel, High Sulfur - Off Road 10,000 Gallons $34,994.0000 $35,369.0000

Totals $3,609,899.6000 $3,645,449.6000

Group One - Tank Wagon Loads

Group Two - Transport Loads

Group Three - Tank Wagon Loads

Group Four - Transport Loads



14-0618 / Fuel Products  Tabulation of Bids Opened 4-2-14
Great Lakes Petroleum Co.             

Cleveland, OH

Petroleum Traders Corp.              Fort 

Wayne, IN

Port Consolidated                                  

Tampa, FL

Item # 11 Each No Bid No Bid $3.4860

Kerosene 300 Gallons $1,045.8000

Totals $1,045.8000

Item # 12 No Bid No Bid No Bid

LP Gas 300 Gallons  

Totals

Item # 13 No Bid No Bid $3.945700

Bio Diesel Quantity Unknown

Totals  

Item # 14 No Bid $3.738800 $3.820700

Bio Diesel Quantity Unknown  

Totals  

Item # 15 No Bid No Bid

Tank, 500 gal capacity Quantity Unknown $300.00 delivery fee

Additional Sizes:

Tank, 2000 gal capacity Quantity Unknown $1000.00 delivery fee

Tank, 12000 gal capacity Quantity Unknown $3000.00 delivery fee

Group Seven - Tank Wagon Loads

Group Eight - Transport Loads

Group Five - Tank Wagon Loads

Group Six - Tank Wagon Loads

Add/Alternate Item(s)



14-0618 / Fuel Products  Tabulation of Bids Opened 4-2-14
Great Lakes Petroleum Co.             

Cleveland, OH

Petroleum Traders Corp.                  

Fort Wayne, IN

Port Consolidated                                  

Tampa, FL

2,000 to 4,000 Gallon trailer per day No Bid No Bid $200.00

4,000 to 6,000 Gallon trailer per day No Bid No Bid $250.00

6,000 to 8,000 Gallon trailer per day No Bid No Bid $400.00

Additional sizes: - - -

No exceptions. No exceptions. No exceptions.

Additional Notes: Back order haul charge: $75.00 Back order haul charge: $150.00 Back order haul charge: $0.00

Min order: 250 gallons tankwagon; 

7500 gallons transport.

Min order: 7000 gal diesel; 8000 gal 

gas Min order: None

Less than min fee: $75.00 Less than min fee: $150.00 Less than min fee: $0.00

Group Nine - Option for On-Site Transport Trailers in and Emergency Situation - Diesel / Transport


