Vendor Tabulation

09-0804

Ferrell Gas Gate Fuel Service Lynch Oil Co. Midstream Fuel On-Site Fuel Petroleum Traders | Port Consolidated RC Dunn QOil
Prlando Tampa Orlando Tampa Orlando Orlando Orlando Orlando

Group One - Tank Wagon Loads
Item#1 No Bid No Bid $1.933310 No Bid $1.932264 No Bid $1.899850 $2.032464
Unleaded Gasoline 87 Octane 160,000 Gallons 309,329.6000 309,162.2400 303,976.0000 325,194.2400
Item # 2 No Bid No Bid $1.973610 No Bid $2.000564 No Bid $1.969950 $2.111464
Unleaded Gasoline 89 Octane 54,000 Gallons 106,574.9400 108,030.4560 106,377.3000 114,019.0560
Item # 3 No Bid No Bid $2.128910 No Bid $2.159364 No Bid $2.127050 $2.262464
Unleaded Gasoline 92/93 Octane 20,000 Gallons 42,578.2000 43,187.2800 42,541.0000 45,249.2800

Totals $458,482.740000 $460,379.976000 $452,894.300000 $484,462.576000
Group Two - Transport Loads
Item #4 No Bid $1.862870 $1.868310 $1.874960 No Bid $1.861960 $1.827850 $1.970964
Unleaded Gasoline 87 Octane 240,000 Gallons 447,088.8000 448,394.4000 449,990.4000 446,870.4000 438,684.0000 473,031.3600
Item#5 No Bid $1.932270 $1.938610 $1.945460 No Bid $1.932060 $1.897950 $2.049964
Unleaded Gasoline 89 Octane 10,000 Gallons 19,322.7000 19,386.1000 19,454.6000 19,320.6000 18,979.5000 20,499.6400
Item # 6 No Bid $2.089770 $2.093910 $2.103360 No Bid $2.089060 $2.055050 $2.200964
Unleaded Gasoline 92/93 Octane 1,500 Gallons 3,134.6550 3,140.8650 3,155.0400 3,133.5900 3,082.5750 3,301.4460

Totals $469,546.155000 $470,921.365000 $472,600.040000 $469,324.590000 $460,746.075000 $496,832.446000
Group Three - Tank Wagon Loads
Item #7 Each No Bid No Bid $2.102220 No Bid $2.010114 No Bid $1.980000 $2.115414
Diesel, Ultra Low Sulfur 120,000 Gallons 252,266.4000 241,213.6800 237,600.0000 253,849.6800
Item # 8 Each No Bid No Bid $1.809120 No Bid $1.838246 No Bid $1.684900 $1.821414
Diesel, High Sulfer - Off Road 80,000 Gallons 144,729.6000 147,059.6800 134,792.0000 145,713.1200

Totals 396,996.0000 388,273.3600 372,392.0000 399,562.8000
Group Four - Transport Loads
Item #9 Each No Bid $1.946020 $1.957220 $1.988110 No Bid $1.952910 $1.913000 $2.053614
Diesel, Ultra Low Sulfur 300,000 Gallons 583,806.0000 587,166.0000 596,433.0000 585,873.0000 573,900.0000 616,084.2000
Item # 10 Each No Bid $1.653220 $1.664120 $1.681810 No Bid $1.667210 $1.617900 $1.759614

Diesel, High Sulfur - Off Road

10,000 Gallons

16,532.2000

16,641.2000

16,818.1000

16,672.1000

16,179.0000

17,596.1400

Totals

600,338.2000

603,807.2000

613,251.1000

602,545.1000

590,079.0000

633,680.3400
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Ferrell Gas Gate Fuel Service Lynch Oil Co. Midstream Fuel On-Site Fuel Petroleum Traders | Port Consolidated RC Dunn Oil
Prlando Tampa Orlando Tampa Orlando Orlando Orlando Orlando

Group Five - Tank Wagon Loads
Item # 11 Each No Bid No Bid $4.640160 No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.046250 No Bid
Kerosene 300 Gallons 1,392.0480 613.8750

Totals 1,392.0480 613.8750
Group Six - Tank Wagon Loads
Item # 12 $1.031000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
LP Gas 300 Gallons $309.300000

Totals 309.3000
Group Seven - Tank Wagon Loads
Item # 13 No Bid No Bid $2.109690 No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.019000 No Bid
Bio Diesel Quantity Unknown

Totals 2.1097 2.0190
Group Eight - Transport Loads
Item # 14 No Bid No Bid $1.964690 No Bid No Bid $2.921610 $1.935000 No Bid
Bio Diesel Quantity Unknown

Totals 1.964690 2.921610 1.935000
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Ferrell Gas Gate Fuel Service Lynch Oil Co. Midstream Fuel On-Site Fuel Petroleum Traders | Port Consolidated RC Dunn Oil
Prlando Tampa Orlando Tampa Orlando Orlando Orlando Orlando
Group Nine - Option for On-Site Transport Trailers in and Emergency Situation - Diesel / Transport
2,000 to 4,000 Gallon trailer per day No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $350.0000 No Bid
4,000 to 6,000 Gallon trailer per day No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $350.0000 No Bid
6,000 to 8,000 Gallon trailer per day No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $350.0000 No Bid
We will ensure that
you have your fuel.
The liability of
leaving one of our
We can provide a | tanks unmanned is
copy of too high. Also, we
memorandum of need & use every
Depends on need |understanding upon truck we have 4400 Gallon /
Additional sizes: No Bid No Bid and availability request following storms. $550.00 No Bid

Additional Notes:

Note on # 14 - soy
bio diesel through
a common carrier.
No listing in the
OPIS, Orlando for
soy bio diesel. If
soy bio diesel
would no longer be
available we
reserve the right to
change to the
available product
of bio diesel *This
is a $1.00 per
gallon credit




