










































































































Attachment 4 - Furniture Pricing Table

Pricing below reflects delivery of all items to the South Lake Regional Service Center, Northeast Regional Service Center and Optional Items separately.

Locations below indicate that there is a need for the quantity listed at each location.

Manufacturer, Model/Part Number, and all colors and fabric should be the same at each location.

Group 1 - Workstations NOTE: References in brochures are representational only. Finishes may vary.

Item

 #

Quantity 

at 

Northeast 

Location

Quantity 

at South 

Lake 

Location Northeast Location South Lake Location

Unit

Purchase

Price

Unit

Install

Price

Total

Unit

Price

Extended

Price for 

Northeast and 

South Lake 

Locations

Cut Sheet 

Attached? Manufacturer Model/Part Number

CWP Customer Computer work 

station. Rm # currently 

unasigned

CWP Customer Computer work 

station. Rm 117

1165.17 116.517 1281.687 2563.374 YES Teknion Multiple, please see drawings

1 Standard work desk with privacy panel
1 1 drawer box

1 1 drawer hanging file drawer

1 Pelican 1 type drawer

Side A Stations 1 - 8, Side B 

Stations 1 - 10

Side A Stations 1 - 8, Side B 

Stations 1 - 9

3403.59 340.359 3743.949 131038.215 YES Teknion/Symmetry Multiple, please see drawings

1 L-shaped work surface (vary in sizes and 

configuration based on cubicle size per drawings)

1 2-drawer (file-file) full depth pedestal (locking)

1 3-drawer (box-box-file) full depth pedestal 

(locking) (Included in Diebold)

1 Pelican 1 type drawer

1 CPU Holder Under Counter Mount

1 Dual Arm Articulating Monitor Mount

Side A Stations 9 - 12, Side B 

Stations 11 -14, Rm. MPO, Office, 

& Dealer

Side A Stations 9 - 12, Side B 

Stations 11 -14, Rm 107, 113,  

115, 117 

2843.5 284.35 3127.85 71940.55 YES Teknion/Symmetry Multiple, please see drawings

1 L-shaped work surface (vary in sizes and 

configuration based on cubicle size per drawings)

1 2-drawer (file-file) full depth pedestal (locking)

1 3-drawer (box-box-file) full depth pedestal 

(locking) (Included in Diebold)

1 Pelican 1 type drawer

1 CPU Holder Under Counter Mount

1 Dual Arm Articulating Monitor Mount

Sr Office Rm 111 481.79 48.179 529.969 2119.876 YES Teknion/Symmetry Multiple, please see drawing

1 Pelican 1 type drawer

1 CPU Holder Under Counter Mount

1 Dual Arm Articulating Monitor Mount

Testing 108 241.56 24.156 265.716 4251.456 YES Teknion/Symmetry Multiple, please see cut sheets

1 Rectangular Work surfaces (varies in size and 

configuration based on size per drawings)

CIC Not on plans DELETED

1 L- shaped work surface

1 Noise reduction panels within the cubicle desks 

and walls1 2-drawer (file-file) full depth pedestal (locking)

2 Overhead shelf

1 Under shelf light

1 Pelican 1 type drawer

1 CPU Holder Under Counter Mount

1 Dual Arm Articulating Monitor Mount

Item

 # North South Location Location

Unit

Purchase

Price

Unit

Install

Price

Total

Unit

Price

Extended

Price for 

Northeast and 

South Lake 

Locations

Cut Sheet

Attached? Manufacturer Model/Part Number

A 4 4 Lobby Lobby 605.48 60.548 666.028 5328.224 Yes Ideon Aviera Wood/Multiseating 2 Seater VRF.SN2.FM2.AC0.SW21 GRADE 2 FABRIC/VINYL SINGLE UPH.

B 6 6 Lobby Lobby 919.35 91.935 1011.285 12135.42 Yes Ideon Aviera Wood/Multiseating 3 Seater VRF.SN3.FM2.AC0.SW21 GRADE 2 FABRIC/VINYL SINGLE UPH.

Group 2 - Seating

Three Seater with Arms

Two Seater with Arms

08 Customer Information Center (CIC) (Northeast Regional 

Service Center) - consisting of:

H

E 8 8

12C 11

D 2 2

A 1 1

B 18 17

Description

Senior Clerk office consisting of:

Testing Area - consisting of:

Modular Low Workstation - consisting of: 

CWP Offices - consisting of:

Modular High Workstation - consisting of: (Includes (2) 

Photo Booths per drawing)

RFP 17-0401, Provide and Install Furniture for Tax Collector's Offices

Description



C 5 5 Lobby Lobby 637.88 63.788 701.668 7016.68 Yes Ideon Composium Bench 3 Seat Wood Tapered legs CP.FS2.SN3 See Brochure Pg.13 GRADE 2 FABRIC/VINYL SINGLE UPH.

D 4 4 Lobby Lobby 1028.7 102.87 1131.57 9052.56 Yes Ideon Composium Bench Double Seat wood Tapered Legs CP.FS2.SN2 Brochure Pg.13 GRADE 2 FABRIC/VINYL SINGLE UPH.

E 42 42 Lobby Lobby 338.99 33.899 372.889 31322.676 Yes Ideon Aviera Wood Guest Chair Single Seat VRG.FM2.SW21  GRADE 2 FABRIC/VINYL SINGLE UPH.

F 14 14 CWP CWP 155.88 15.588 171.468 4801.104 Yes SitonIt Freelance/4 Leg Side Chair 5214 Please see brochure Pg. 6 FABRIC/VINYL GRADE 2

G 16 16 Customer Service ADA Stations Customer Service ADA Stations 155.88 15.588 171.468 5486.976 Yes SitonIt Freelance/4 Leg Side Chair 5214 Please see brochure Pg. 6  FABRIC/VINYL GRADE 2

H 8 8 Customer Service Area Photo 

Booth

Customer Service Area Photo 

Booth

155.88 15.588 171.468 2743.488 Yes SitonIt Freelance/4 Leg Side Chair/with arms 5214 Please see brochure Pg. 6  FABRIC/VINYL GRADE 2

I 8 8  Customer Service Area Written 

Test

Customer Service Area Written 

Test

155.88 15.588 171.468 2743.488 Yes SitonIt Freelance/4 Leg Side Chair 5214 Please see brochure Pg.6  FABRIC/VINYL GRADE 2

K 8 8 MPO, Office, Dealer Rm 113, 107, 115,  107 155.88 15.588 171.468 2743.488 Yes SitonIt Freelance/4 Leg Side Chair 5214 Please see brochure Pg.6  FABRIC/VINYL GRADE 2

L 32 32 Side A Stations 1 - 8, Side B 

Stations 1 - 10

Side A Stations 1 - 8, Side B 

Stations 1 - 9

228.96 22.896 251.856 16118.784 Yes SitonIt Focus Midback Stool 5622BB1.A92S  FABRIC/VINYL GRADE 2

M 25 25 Side A Stations 9 - 12, Side B 

Stations 11 -14, Rm. MPO, Office, 

& Dealer

Side A Stations 9 - 12, Side B 

Stations 11 -14, Rm 107, 113,  

115, 117 

194.76 19.476 214.236 10711.8 Yes SitonIt Focus Midback Swivel Tilt 5622TB1.A92 Brochure Last Page  FABRIC/VINYL GRADE 2

N 5 5 Reception & SR Office Reception 196.56 19.656 216.216 2162.16 Yes SitonIt Focus Midback Armless  Task Stool 5622.BBS.S1  FABRIC/VINYL GRADE 2

O 0 4 Admin Admin 155.66 15.566 171.226 684.904 Yes Global Total Office Arno Highback Tilter 4003 GENUINE MOCK/LEATHER COMBO FABRIC (Black) Spec Attached

P 12 12 Break Room Break Room 163.8 16.38 180.18 4324.32 Yes SitonIt Inflex 971.A121 Brochure Last Page FABRIC GRADE 2

Group 3 - Tables

Item

 # North South Location Location

Unit

Purchase

Price

Unit

Install

Price

Total

Unit

Price

Extended

Price for 

Northeast and 

South Lake 

Locations

Cut Sheet

Attached? Manufacturer Model/Part Number

A 3 3 Breakroom Breakroom 282.48 28.248 310.728 1864.368 Yes Teknion Square Meeting Table 4 point base BCMNSF48  Brochure Last Page #12       

B 1 1 Admin Admin DELETED

C 10 10 Lobby Lobby 432.95 43.295 476.245 9524.9 Yes Ideon Mezzanine Square MZM.TT8.TZ21.TH21   Brochure Pg. 14

D 4 4 Customer Service Area Photo 

Booth

Customer Service Area Photo 

Booth

432.95 43.295 476.245 3809.96 Yes Ideon Mezzanine Square MZM.TT8.TZ21.TH21 Brochure Pg. 14 

E 2 2 CWP Room CWP Room 432.95 43.295 476.245 1904.98 Yes Ideon Mezzanine Square MZM.TT8.TZ21.TH21  Brochure Pg. 14 

F 5 5 Break Room Breakroom 432.95 43.295 476.245 4762.45 Yes Ideon Mezzanine Square MZM.TT8.TZ21.TH21  Brochure Pg. 14 

G 3 3 Storage/Receiving Room Storage/Receiving Room 282.48 28.248 310.728 1864.368 Yes Teknion Square Meeting Table 4 Point Base BCMNSF48 Brochure Last Page #12   

Item

 # North South Location Location

Unit

Purchase

Price

Unit

Install

Price

Total

Unit

Price

Extended

Price for 

Northeast and 

South Lake 

Locations

Cut Sheet

Attached? Manufacturer Model/Part Number

A 1 1 License plate room License plate room NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

B 2 2 Receiving Room Storage / Receiving Room NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Optional Item:  Group 5 - DIEBOLD Cash Management System

Item

 #

Quantity 

at North 

Location

Quantity 

at South 

Location Locations Locations

Unit

Purchase

Price

Unit

Install

Price

Total

Unit

Price

Extended

Price for 

Northeast and 

South Lake 

Locations

A 12 12 Workstation #s unassigned 

currently although substantively 

identical to SL floor plan. Rms. 

CWP, Office, MPO & Dealer

Side A Stations 9 - 12, Side B 

Stations 11 -14, Rm 107, 113 , 

115  117 

498.24 49.824 548.064 13153.536

B 33 30 Workstation #s unassigned 

currently although substantively 

identical to SL floor plan. Rms. 

CWP, Office, MPO & Dealer

Side A Stations 9 - 12, Side B 

Stations 11 -14, 107, 113 , 115, 

117, Side A Stations 1 - 8, Side B 

Stations 1 - 10

65.65 6.565 72.215 4549.545

D 21 21 Workstation #s unassigned 

currently although substantively 

identical to SL floor plan. 

Side A Stations 9 - 12, Side B 

Stations 11 -14, 107 (Consult), 

113 (Dealer), 115 (Sr. Off), 117 

(MPO), Side A Stations 1 - 8, Side 593.48

59.348 652.828 27418.776

E 66 66 Workstation #s unassigned 

currently although substantively 

identical to SL floor plan. Rms. 

CWP, Office, MPO & Dealer

Side A Stations 9 - 12, Side B 

Stations 11 -14, 107 (Consult), 

113 (Dealer), 115 (Sr. Off), 117 

(MPO), Side A Stations 1 - 8, Side 

B Stations 1 - 10 47.86

4.786 52.646 6949.272

Description

DIEBOLD Topaz Model SD-2-XX-GL (Ganglocked) Under 

counter pedestal, two drawer, one package.  00-022043-

000A.  Secured to Floor

Drawer Filing Insert (Package) 00-022092-000A

DIEBOLD Topaz Model SU-3-XX-GL (smaller cannot be gang 

locked as discussed)Under counter pedestal, drawer 

drawer, two package. 00-0021-000A.  Secured to Floor

DIEBOLD Cap Model PC-SW Product 221-10

Three Seat Bench (approx. 65x26x18)

Modular storage shelving 

Group 4 - Shelving

Conference Room Table, pop-up Electrical/Communications 

Module

End Table, wood veneer (approximately 20x20x20)

End Table, wood veneer (approximately 20x20x20)

End Table, wood veneer (approximately 20x20x20)

End Table, wood veneer (approximately 20x20x20)

Table, 4 person

Description

Modular shelving for license plate inventory

Heavy Duty Swivel Stool Chair

Conference Room Chair, High back chairs

Single chair with arms

Table, 4 person

Description

Single chair with arms

Single chair with arms

High task chair

Low task chair

Four Seat Bench

Single chair with arms

Single chair with arms

Single chair with arms

Single chair with arms



F 66 66 Workstation #s unassigned 

currently although substantively 

identical to SL floor plan. Rms. 

CWP, Office, MPO & Dealer

Side A Stations 9 - 12, Side B 

Stations 11 -14, 107 (Consult), 

113 (Dealer), 115 (Sr. Off), 117 

(MPO), Side A Stations 1 - 8, Side 

B Stations 1 - 10 Included

included included included

G 33 33 Workstation #s unassigned 

currently although substantively 

identical to SL floor plan. Rms. 

CWP, Office, MPO & Dealer

Side A Stations 9 - 12, Side B 

Stations 11 -14, 107 (Consult), 

113 (Dealer), 115 (Sr. Off), 117 

(MPO), Side A Stations 1 - 8, Side 

B Stations 1 - 10

0 0 0

Locks and install not quoted

H 33 33 Workstation #s unassigned 

currently although substantively 

identical to SL floor plan. Rms. 

CWP, Office, MPO & Dealer

Side A Stations 9 - 12, Side B 

Stations 11 -14, 107 (Consult), 

113 (Dealer), 115 (Sr. Off), 117 

(MPO), Side A Stations 1 - 8, Side 

B Stations 1 - 10

0 0 0

Locks and install not quoted

I 33 33

Side A Stations 9 - 12, Side B 

Stations 11 -14, 107 (Consult), 

113 (Dealer), 115 (Sr. Off), 117 

(MPO), Side A Stations 1 - 8, Side 

B Stations 1 - 10

Side A Stations 9 - 12, Side B 

Stations 11 -14, 107 (Consult), 

113 (Dealer), 115 (Sr. Off), 117 

(MPO), Side A Stations 1 - 8, Side 

B Stations 1 - 10 96.89

9.689 106.579 7034.214

1 1 ICS Design Required 3920.4 3920.4 7840.8

17 17 ADVANCED ELECTRIC: ELECTRICIAN ESTIMATED PROPER PLANS/CAD NEEDED TO VERIFY 295 5015 10030

Total Cost of all items purchased under this solicitation 429996.712

Under Counter Lock MASTER Keyed Compx locks 

410192125XXA

Cash Tray Kit M-1500-CTK Plastic Cash Drawer, Locking 

Cover 00022083000A

Under Counter Lock Non Master Keyed Compx Locks 

410192015XXA

Drawer Filing Card Support 21-015064-000A


